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Regarding A Nick Brown MP re: Office Costs Budget Overspend

Dear Mr Brown and -

I do apologise for the delay in getting back to you.

Our Finance team have advised that a total of £9,660.00 has been  Attachments

paid to _ on 06 February 2020. The reference is

I | can't see any other payment has gone out for
this property.

File Name

No Email Attachment reco

Please could you have another look at your records and let me 0 - 0 of 0 (0 selected) Page 1
know a reference number if there has indeed been another
payment?

If you have any further queries, please do let me know.

Kind regards,

Account Manager

Independent Parliamentary Standards Authority (IPSA)

2"d Floor
85 Strand
London WC2R ODW

General enquiries: 020 7811 6400

info@theipsa.org.uk
www.theipsa.org.uk

Follow us on Twitter: @ipsauk

https://iris.theipsa.org.uk/_forms/print/print.aspx?id=%7b86354769-4A59-EA11-80F0-000C2986DEF2%7d&objectType=4200&subType=4202 1/3
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There are important deadlines to meet for the financial year ending
on 31 March 2020. Click here to access information and guidance.

------------------- Original Message ------==========---
From: Nicholas Brown

Received: 21/02/2020 10:46

To: <Enquiry>
Cc:
Subject: Nick Brown MP re: Office Costs Budget Overspend

For the urgent attention of . and.

I am following up on the phone call you had this morning with my Office
Manager.

From looking on my IPSA online account at my ‘Account Details’ for my
‘Office Costs Budget’ | can see that IPSA have paid the landlord for my
constituency office (GMB Northern) too much.

As far as | am aware the total rent that should have been paid to -
-s £9,660 (the cost of the rent on the new tenancy agreement).

 have copiec NN

into this email who I think it would be beneficial for you to talk with
directly to clear up the confusion about how much they need to refund in
order to sort this issue.

I would be grateful if this could be sorted as soon as possible.
With best wishes,
Nick

Rt Hon Nick Brown MP
Member of Parliament for Newcastle upon Tyne East

Tel: 0191 249 8403 (Newcastle) | 020 7219 6814 (Westminster)

Email: nickbrownmp@parliament.uk

Website: www.nickbrownmp.com
le./Users/roycrofta/Library/Containers/com.microsoft.Outlook/Data/Libr
452

You can find a copy of my Privacy Policy on my website at www.nickbrownmp.com/my-privacy-policy
UK Parliament Disclaimer: this e-mail is confidential to the
intended recipient. If you have received it in error, please
notify the sender and delete it from your system. Any
unauthorised use, disclosure, or copying is not permitted. This
e-mail has been checked for viruses, but no liability is accepted
for any damage caused by any virus transmitted by this e-mail.
This e-mail address is not secure, is not encrypted and should
not be used for sensitive data.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email
Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit

https://iris.theipsa.org.uk/_forms/print/print.aspx?id=%7b86354769-4A59-EA11-80F0-000C2986DEF2%7d&objectType=4200&subType=4202 2/3



21/07/2021 Email: RE: Nick Brown MP re: Office Costs Budget Overspend Tracking 1D:0226000624
http:/ /www.symanteccloud.com

Delay Email Until 27/02/2020 10:28

https://iris.theipsa.org.uk/_forms/print/print.aspx?id=%7b86354769-4A59-EA11-80F0-000C2986DEF2%7d&objectType=4200&subType=4202 3/3





