
Shoreline Overview 
  
 
Shoreline 
Shoreline is a monthly gathering for high 
school students marked by fun, music, and 
practical teaching from the Bible.  
  
Small Group 
Shoreline Small Groups meet weekly and are 
built around relationships and learning from 
God’s Word together. Curriculum is available 
via PDF or the Shoreline app each semester. 
 
Community Group 
Reserved for Watermark members who desire 
to be fully committed to living in authentic 
community. Community Groups typically meet 
at a different time and place than Small Group. 
 
Hideaway 
Hideaway is a weekend retreat that gets high 
school students out of the hustle and bustle of 
Dallas life and into an environment where they 
can rest, experience God, and hang out with 
friends. Hideaway typically happens in late 
September or early October. 
  
DTown 
DTown is our biggest event of the year! It’s an 
annual, local Friday through Sunday retreat 
hosted by Watermark Dallas and more than 
100 homes around the church. DTown is 
typically held on Super Bowl weekend. 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 

Senior Dessert 
Senior Dessert is a time for students, parents, 
and leaders to remember what God has done 
through Small Groups, honor the relationships 
that He has given us, and look forward to what 
He might build next on the foundation that He 
has laid. 
  
International Trip 
An international trip with is a powerful way to 
make an impact on others, grow as a leader, 
and deepen friendships! We take an 
international trip during the summer, typically 
in partnership with Mission of Hope. 
  
Camp Barnabas 
Located in southwest Missouri, Camp Barnabas 
is a Christian camp for individuals with special 
needs. Each year Watermark takes a group of 
high schoolers up to Camp Barnabas for a 
week-long experience of hands on, Christ-
centered ministry.   
  
LEAD Team 
LEAD Team is for high school students who 
desire to develop as Christian leaders. 
Students will be equipped and encouraged 
with specific leadership tools to help them 
minister to others. 
 


